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.
INTRODUCTION

This appeal involves the authority of the Personal

Representative in a nonintervention probate to possession of estate
property and to administer that property during the pendency of
probate proceedings. At issue is an award of attorney’s fees and
costs against Appellant William “Bill” Miller (hereinafter “Bill") that
the Personal Representative incurred to regain possession of the
decedent’s house from so the house could be listed and sold.

Dorothy Miller's Will made no specific bequests of real
property to any of the heirs. The Estate property included
Dorothy’s house located at 1356 University St., Walla Walla. Bill
moved into the house, shortly after Dorothy died in 2011. He lived
there for over 46 months without paying any compensation or rent
to Estate. He was removed from the house on July 27, 2015.

The Will provided that Bill is to receive 40% of the estate
residue. Bill expressed his desire to receive the house as his
distributive share of the Estate. However, he acknowledged that the
value of the house was greater than his anticipated share of the
residue. The Personal Representative, John Miller (hereinafter

“John” or the “Personal Representative”), determined that if Bill was




to receive the house, he would need to obtain financing to make up
the difference. Bill was unable to secure the necessary financing,

but nevertheless refused to move out of the house. The Walla

Walla Superior Court ordered Bill to vacate the house so that it
could be listed and sold. Bill ignored the Court’s Order to Vacate
and continued to live in the house. John was then required to
resort to unlawful detainer proceedings to remove Bill and two of
his friends from the house. The Estate incurred substantial
attorney’s fees and costs, both in the probate proceedings and in
the related unlawful detainer action, to restore possession of the
house to the Personal Representative. After Bill was finally
removed from the house, it was listed and sold.

John sought an order from the Superior Court assessing
attorney’s fees and costs against Bill with respect to proceedings to
remove Bill and to restore possession of the house to the Personal
Representative. The Superior Court granted the motion and
awarded $11,315.00 in attorney’s fees and $3,260.20 in costs as a
charge against Bill's share of the estate residue. The Superior
Court denied Bill Miller's Motion for reconsideration and this appeal

followed.



L.
RESPONSE TO ASSIGNMENTS OF ERROR

Assignments of Error 1, 3, 5 and 6 all appear to relate to the

award of attorney’s fees and costs and, construed liberally, contend
that the trial court's award of fees and costs was in error. The
remaining assignments of error are irrelevant to the issues at issue
in this appeal. Respondent believes the sole issue for
determination by this Court is, did the Walla Walla Superior Court
abuse its discretion in awarding attorney’s fees and costs under
RCW 11.96A.150 against Bill with respect to proceedings to restore
possession of the decedents house to the Personal

Representative?

il
STATEMENT OF THE CASE

A. Factual Background.

Dorothy Miller died testate on September 14, 2011, having
executed her Last Will and Testament on November 4, 2008. CP
374. Dorothy's heirs included her adult sons, John A. Miller and
William D. Miller, adult daughter Lori Montgomery, and four

grandchildren. CP 368, 375. Dorothy Miller's Last Will and



Testament made specific cash bequests to her grandchildren. CP
370. The Will made no specific bequests or devises to John, Bill or

Lori. Rather, Dorothy bequeathed the residue of her estate to John

and Bill in shares of forty percent each and the remaining twenty
percent to Lori. CP 370. The Will named John and Bill to serve as
co-Personal Representatives, to serve with nonintervention powers.
CP 371. The Walla Walla Superior Court admitted the Will to
probate on September 21, 2011, and appointed John and Bill co-
Personal Representatives with nonintervention powers. CP 374-
376. They were represented initially by attorney Larry Siegel. CP
141, §] 3; CP 374-376.

In 2013, John determined that Bill had used Estate funds to
purchase numerous personal items and to pay various personal
expenses, such as medical expenses, cable bills, and video rentals.
CP 141-142, § 6. As a consequence, on May 24, 2013, Bill
resigned as co-Personal Representative. CP 142, q 6; CP 377.
Larry Siegel withdrew as the Estate’s attorney and the undersigned
David S. Grossman appeared as counsel for John in his role as

Personal Representative.' CP 130, 4-5.

' Bill insists on referring to counsel as John's personal attorney. Such is not the
case. At all times, David S. Grossman has served as attorney for John Miller in
his capacity as Personal Representative of the Estate.



The major assets of the Estate consisted of three houses in
Walla Walla: two houses located on J St. and Bush St., Walla

Walla, and Dorothy’s personal residence located at 1356

University Street. CP 002 [ 6; CP 130 § 6; CP 141, [ 5. Dorothy
also had a bank account with a balance of approximately $30,000.
CP 141, 7 1 4-5. The account was held in the joint names of
Dorothy, John and Bill, with right of survivorship. CP 141, § 4.
However, Article V of the Will was a “Super WIill” provision,
authorized by RCW 11.11.020. It stated: “It is my intent that all
assets held in my name, whether in joint account format or with a
designated beneficiary, shall pass in accordance with the terms of
this, my Last Will and Testament.” CP 141, { 4; CP 371. Funds
from the bank accounts were used principally to satisfy the specific
bequests to grandchildren and to finance renovations to the two
rental houses. CP 141, 5. This was agreed to between John and
Bill after consulting with then-Estate attorney Larry Siegel. CP 147.
The rental houses were listed for sale and were sold to third
parties. CP 002, [ 7; CP 141, 7/ 5.

Bill moved into Dorothy’s University Street house shortly
after her death. CP 002, | 10; CP 235, { 1; CP 110, {1/ 5-6.. At

no time did he pay any rent or other compensation to the Estate in



consideration of his occupation of the house. CP 002, | 10; CP
235, 3. He expressed an interest in receiving the house as his

distributive share of the Estate. CP 013; CP 143-145. Bill

acknowledged, however, that the house was valued more than his
share of the Estate residue. CP 013; CP 143. If Bill was to receive
the house, it was necessary that he obtain financing to make up the
shortfal. CP 143. Bill recognized and acknowledged that
additional financing would be necessary for him to receive the
house. CP 013, §111; CP 110, ] 5-6.

After the J St. and Bush St. houses were sold, John made
an interim distribution of $40,000 to himself and $20,000 to Lori
Montgomery. CP 146-147. No distribution was made to Bill
because of his expressed desire to receive the University St. house
as his distributive share of the Estate. A cash distribution would
have reduced Bill's remaining distributive share of the estate,
requiring him to borrow more funds to make up the difference
between his ultimate share and the value of the house. CP 146;
CP 110, 5 (Declaration of Bill Miller).

On February 15, 2014, John, through Estate counsel,
proposed to Bill a price of $152,000 as a fair price for the University

Street house. CP 003, [ 16. The letter stated “If an agreement:



can’'t be reached regarding the purchase price for the house, and
you do not ultimately proceed with the transaction, it will be

incumbent on John Miller to list the house for sale to a third party.”

CP 003, § 16. No substantive response was ever received from Bill
Miller to this proposal. 1d. After nearly four months of no progress,
Bill was served on June 4, 2014, with a 20-day notice to vacate the
premises. CP 003, 17.2

On July 3, 2014, an unlawful detainer action was filed under
Walla Walla Superior Court Cause No. 14-2-00454-1. CP 004, |
18. Bill did not timely appear at a Show Cause hearing and the
Court issued a Writ of Restitution. CP 004, § 20. Thereafter, Bill
delivered to counsel a note expressing continuing interest in
purchasin.g the University Street house. CP 004, | 21. John, as
Personal Representative, agreed to suspend the unlawful detainer
and to vacate the Writ of Restitution to allow Bill further time to
secure financing. CP 004, | 22. After a delay of almost three

months with no progress being made, Bill Miler finally

2 Attorney Brandon Johnson appeared in the probate proceedings on Bill's behalf
on April 17, 2014. CP 380. Notwithstanding Mr. Johnson's involvement on Bill
Miller's behalf, no progress was made toward arriving at an agreed value for the
University Street house and terms for Bill to make up any difference between his
share of the Estate and the value of the house. Mr. Johnson withdrew by Notice
dated July 3, 2014.



acknowledged that he had not even made an application for a loan.
CP 004-005, 11 22-25.

As a result of the long delay of many months (February 2014

to October 2014), during which Bill took no action to apply for a
loan, John filed a Petition for Instructions asking, among other
things, that the Court establish a timetable for Bill to apply for
financing, to provide evidence of a preliminary commitment for
financing and to close the purchase of the University Street house.
CP 384-390. The Petition was filed October 31, 2014. CP 384-
390. The Petition also asked the Court to set a fair rental value to
be charged to Bill to compensate the Estate for his occupation of
the house, as well as other relief not relevant to this appeal. CP
389-390.

On December 12, 2014, following a hearing at which Bill was
represented by attorney Lenard Wittlake, the Superior Court
entered an Initial Order on Petition for Instructions (“Initial Order”).
CP 025-027. The Initial Order directed that on or before December
18, 2014, Bill was to submit one or more applications for a real
estate loan in the amount of $50,000, and on or before January 7,
2015, he was to provide evidence of a preliminary financing

commitment. Id. The Initial Order further provided that if Bill did



not apply for a loan, or did not receive a commitment for financing,
the Court would order Bill to vacate the house by January 31, 2015,

after which the house would be listed for sale. CP 026. The Court

reserved for further proceedings all other requests raised in the
Petition for Instructions, including the Personal Representative’s
request for an award of attorney’s fees and an order to charge Bill a
fair rent for the University Street house. Id.

Although Bill applied to GESA Credit Union for financing, he
did not receive a preliminary loan commitment. CP 033-034. On
January 9, 2015, John filed a Motion for Order to Vacate House,
seeking an order requiring Bill to vacate the University Street
house. CP 033-034. Bill, still represented by Lenard Wittlake,
opposed the motion. CP 35-36. Following a hearing on the Motion,
the Superior Court entered an Order to Vacate, requiring Bill to
vacate the house on or before midnight, March 2, 2015. CP 054-
055. Bill moved for reconsideration. CP 057; CP 058-061. John
opposed the Motion, arguing that as Personal Representative, he
was entitled to possession of estate property and was entitied to
maintain an action to regain possession of the University Street
house. CP 064-073. The Superior Court denied the Motion for

Reconsideration, giving Bill until March 31, 2015, to vacate the



house. CP 081-082. The Superior Court held that under the
circumstances of the case, John, as Personal Representative, was

entitled to possession of the house. CP 082. The Court ruled that

“further delay engendered by his [Bill's] attempts to gain ownership
of the property is unreasonable.” CP 083. On March 18, 2015,
Lenard Wittlake filed his Notice of Intent to Withdraw as Bill's
attorney. CP 394-395.

Bill ignored the Court’'s Order to Vacate. He continued to
live in the University Street house. CP 131, | 11; CP 143-145.
Consequently, the Personal Representative amended the unlawful
detainer complaint and sought issuance of a Writ of Restitution.
CP 131, 1 13. Bill appeared pro se at a Show Cause hearing in the
unlawful detainer case and objected to issuance of a Writ of
Restitution. Id. He also filed a counterclaim, over which the Court
had no jurisdiction. Id. John was required, therefore, to file a
Motion to Dismiss the counterclaim. 1d. The Superior Court
ordered issuance of a Writ of Restitution.

The Walla Walla Sheriff attempted to execute the Writ on
July 17, 2015. CP 131, § 15. Bill was not present atl the house,
but two individuals were there, behind a padiocked gate. CP 131,

15-16. Both claimed to be Bill's tenants and objected to being

10



removed from the house. CP 131, 9 15. At no time prior to this had
Bill informed John or Estate counsel that anyone but himself was

living in the house. CP 131, § 17. Due to the presence of

individuals claiming to be Bill's tenants, the eviction was called off
and a new Writ of Restitution was issued and served, directing the
Sheriff to remove Bill Miller and all other occupants from the
property. CP 131, 117. On July 27, 2015, the Sheriff executed the
Writ. CP 132, ] 18. Again, Bill was not present, but one of the two
individuals who claimed to be his tenant was present. Id. During
the course of the eviction, she was obstreperous and belligerent.
CP 132, ] 20.

Shortly prior to the eviction, a new attorney — Greg Dow —
appeared for Bill Miller in the probate proceedings.> CP 396. Mr.
Dow filed a Request for Instructions with the Superior Court.* The
Request sought John Miller's removal .as Personal Representative,
the reappointment of Bill Miller as Personal Representative, an
order requiring that the University Street House be sold to Bill
Miller, and requiring the Estate to finance Bill's purchase of the

house, among other relief. CP 114-117. John opposed the

3 Mr. Dow did not appear in the related unlawful detainer action.

4 The Request for Instructions appears not to have been designated to be
included in the Clerk’s papers. The Memorandum filed in support thereof details
the relief Bill sought in his Requests for Instructions. CP 114-117.

11




Requests for Instruction. CP 123-128; CP 140-162. With one
exception, that being the making of a preliminary distribution of

$30,000 to Bill, the Superior Court denied Bill's Request for

Instructions. CP 241-243.

On August 21, 2015, John filed a Motion to charge Bill's
interest in the Estate residue to compensate the Estate for Bill's
rent-free occupation of the University Street house. CP 168-169.
The motion also sought an award of attorney’s fees, also to be a
charge against Bill's share of the Estate residue, and to require Bill
to account for any rents he received by renting out rooms in the
University Street house. CP 168-169. The Declaration of David S.
Grossman, filed on August 13, 2105, detailed the lengthy
procedural history of efforts to remove Bill from the house. CP 129-
133. A further Declaration of David S. Grossman was filed on
August 21, 2015, detailing the encounter with claimed tenants at
the attempted eviction on July 17. CP 170-171.°

On September 22, 2015, the Court entered its Order Re Bill
Miller's Request for Instructions. CP 241-243. The Order denied

all but the request for a partial distribution of cash from the estate.

® Also filed in support of the Motion was the Declaration of Rick Phillips, attesting
that during the period of Bill's occupancy the University Street house had a fair
rental value between $925 and $1,050 monthly. CP 397-398.

12



CP 242. Also on September 22, 2015, the Superior Court entered
its Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law and Order with respect to

the Personal Representative’s Motion to charge Bill's share of the

Estate residue for rent to compensate the Estate for Bill's rent-free
46-month occupancy of the University St. house. CP 234-237. The
Order directed that Bill's interest in the residue would be charged at
the rate of $700 per month for forty-six months. CP 235. The
Order also required Bill to account for any rent received from third
parties and reserved the question of attorney’'s fees for further
proceedings. CP 235. Bill's attorney, Gregory Dow, withdrew by
Notice of Intent to Withdraw filed on December 21, 2015. CP 401.
The protracted and continued refusal of Bill to discuss price
terms for his purchase of the house, his months-long failure to
apply for financing despite his recognition that such financing was
necessary, and his refusal to vacate the house after it was apparent
he could not obtain financing and after the Superior Court ordered
him to vacate resulted in the Estate incurring significant attorney’s
fees and costs. CP 313-316, 340-352. On February 5, 2016, John,
as Personal Representative, filed his Renewed Motion to Charge
Heir's Interest for Attorney’s Fees and Costs. CP 332-333. The

Motion was supported by the Declaration of David Grossman of

13




same date, CP 340-352, the Declaration of John Miller, CP 313-
331, and the August 13, 2015 and October 31, 2015, Declarations

of David S. Grossman (CP 120-139 and CP 170-171)° The Motion

was also supported by a Memorandum of Law. CP 334-339. Bill
did not file any opposition to the Motion.

On February 29, 2016, following a hearing, which Bill
attended, the Superior Court entered its Order Granting Renewed
Motion to Charge Heir's Interest for Attorney Fees and Costs. CP
353-355. The Superior Court assessed attorney’s fees of
$4,707.50 related to the probate proceeding and $6,607.50 in fees
and $3,260.20 in costs related to the unlawful detainer action. The
fees and costs were detailed in the Declaration of David S.
Grossman Re: Renewed Motion for Attorney’s Fees and Costs, CP
340-352, and in the Declaration of John Miller Re: Attorney’s Fees
and Costs. CP 313-331.

Bill filed a Motion for Reconsideration. CP 357-365. On
March 17, 2016, the Superior Court, issued its Decision and Order

Denying Reconsideration. CP 367. In its Decision and Order, the

® Time entries found at CP 340-352 identified with yellow highlighting the specific
entries in the probate matter related to the efforts to remove Bill from the house.
The highlighting was not reproduced when the record was copied and
transmitted to the Court of Appeals. The Appendix hereto contains the
Declaration with exhibits, with the highlighted noted as submitted to the Superior
Court.

14




Court stated: “The matters raised having been previously briefed

and argued extensively by the parties and duly considered by the

Court, the Motion for Reconsideration is hereby DENIED.” CP 367.

Bill's appeal of the Decision and Order Denying Reconsideration

was subsequently filed in the Superior Court.

Procedural History.

A summary of the relevant dates and procedural history may

be of use to the Court of Appeals in considering this appeal.

DATE
09/14/2011

09/21/2011

05/24/2013

10/10/2013

10/24/2013

02/19/2014

04/17/2014

06/04/2014

ACTION
Dorothy Miller dies testate;

Order Admitting Will and Appointing co-PRs.
CP 374-376;

Bill Miller Resigns as co-PR. CP 377;

Attorney Larry Siegel withdraws as attorney for
PR John Miller;

Attorney David Grossman appears for John
Miller, PR;

Letter to Bill Miller with PR’'s offer that
University St. house be sold to him for
$152,000. CP 003, 1 16;

Attorney Brandon Johnson appears for Bill
Miller. CP 380-381,

Bill Miller served with 20-Day notice to Vacate.
CP 003, 1117;

15




07/02/2014

07/03/2014

07/14/2014

Unlawful Detainer proceeding filed under
Cause No. 14-2-00454-1. CP 004, 1 18.

Brandon Johnson withdraws. CP 382-383.

Order for Restitution signed by Judge pro

07/14/2014

07/16/2014

08/22/2014

10/7/2014

10/17/2014

10/31/2014

11/20/2014

12/12/2014

tempore Mitchell. CP 004, q] 20;

Bill Miller delivers note expressing continuing
interest in receiving University St. house. CP
004, 11 21.

Writ of Restitution vacated and letter to Bill
Miller regarding agreement to stay eviction
proceedings to permit Bill to secure financing.
CP 004, 1 22.

Bill Miller writes stating he is not credit worthy
and asking that the house be placed in his
name. CP 004, | 23.

Letter sent to Bill Miller stating that he would
need approximately $55,000 to compensate
estate for his occupancy and to make up
difference between value of house and his
share of the Estate. CP 005, ] 24.

After no further communication since August
22, Bill Miller admits he did not apply for a loan.
CP 005, { 25;

Petition for Instructions filed after no further
contact from Bill Miller. CP 005, q[Y] 26, 28;

Attorney Lenard Wittlake appears for Bill Miller.
CP 393;

Initial Order on Petition for Instructions. CP
025-027;

16



01/09/2015

02/02/2015

PR’s Motion for Order to Vacate after no
certification filed that Bill had secured
preliminary commitment for financing. CP 033-
034;

Order to Vacate entered. Bill Miller to vacate

02/12/2015

03/11/2015

04/08/2015

07/13/2015

07/17/2015

07/27/2015

07/31/2015

08/21/2015

09/22/2015

house by midnight 03/02/2015. CP 054-055.

Bill Miller's Motion to Reconsider Order to
vacate. CP 057.

Order Denying Motion to Reconsider. Bill
Miller ordered to vacate house by March 31,
2015. CP 081-083.

Lenard Wittlake withdraws. CP 394-395.

Attorney Greg Dow appears for Bill Miller. CP
396;

Initial attempt to execute renewed Writ of
Restitution. Two persons at house claiming to
be Bill's tenants. CP 131, {[ 15.

Writ of Execution executed. Bill Miller and
tenant(s) evicted. CP 132, | 19;

Bill Miller's Request for Instructions filed
asking, inter alia, to remove John as PR,
reappoint Bill, require sale of house to Bill and
requiring Estate to finance shortfall between
Biil's share and value of house. CP 114-117..

PR’s Motion to Charge Heir's Interest for Rent
and for Attorney’s Fees. CP 0168-0169;

Order denying Bill Miller's Request for
Instructions. CP 241-243.

17



09/22/2015 Findings of Fact, Conclusions of Law and
Order Granting PR’s Motion to Charge Heir's
Interest, etc. CP 234-238;

12/21/2015 Attorney Greg Dow withdraws as Bill Miller's
attorney. CP401;
02/05/2016 PR's Renewed Motion to Charge Heir's
Interest Attorney’s Fees and Costs. CP 332-
333;
02/29/2016 Order Granting Renewed Motion. CP 353-355;
03/18/2016 Motion for Reconsideration;
03/17/2016 Order Denying Reconsideration.
03/28/2015 Notice of Appeal filed.
Iv.
ARGUMENT

A. Standard of Review.

This is an appeal from an Order assessing attorney’s fees
and costs against Estate beneficiary Bill Miller under RCW
11.96A.150. T

The attorney’s fees and costs were incurred in connection
with the Personal Representative’s efforts to recover possession of
the decedent’s University Street house. The Superior Court’s

award to the Estate was as an offset against Bill Miller’s distributive

18



share of the Estate residue. The award was made under the
authority of RCW 11.96A.150 which, provides in pertinent part:

Either the superior court or any court on an appeal
may, in its discretion, order costs, including

reasonable attorneys' fees, to be awarded to any

party: (a) From any party to the proceedings . . . .

The court may order the costs, including reasonable

attorneys' fees, to be paid in such amount and in such

manner as the court determines to be equitable. In
exercising its discretion under this section, the court

may consider any and all factors that it deems to be

relevant and appropriate, which factors may but need

not include whether the litigation benefits the estate or

trust involved.

RCW 11.96A.150 (1). The statute applies to proceedings involving
decedent’s estates. RCW 11.96A.150(2).

The question whether to award fees under the RCW
11.96.150 lies within the sound discretion of the court. In re Estate
of Black, 153 Wn.2d 173, 102 P.3d 796 (2004). The Court of
Appeals “will not interfere with a trial court's fee determination
unless ‘there are facts and circumstances clearly showing an abuse
of the trial court’'s discretion.” Id. See also Atkinson v. Estate of
Hook, 193 Wn. App. 862, 873-874, 374 P.3d 215 (2016), rev.
denied, 2016 WL 5407920, ___ P.3d ___ (Sept. 28, 2016) (RCW

11.96A.150) allows the Court to exercise “considerable discretion”

in the award of attorney’s fees). A fee award will be upheld “unless

19




it is manifestly unreasonable or based on untenable grounds or
reasons.” Bale v. Allison, 173 Wn. App. 435, 461, 294 P.3d 789,

reconsideration granted, affd in part, revd in part, 173 Wn. App.

435 (2013).

A Court making a fee award is allowed to consider “any
relevant factor” it deems appropriate. In re Estate of Mower, 193
Wn. App. 706, 727-728, 374 P.3d 180 (2016). See also In re
Guardianship of Lamb, 173 Wn.2d 173, 198, 265 P.3d 876 (2011).
Among the factors the Court may consider is whether the litigation
benefits the estate or trust involved. In re Estate of Mower, supra,
193 Wn. App. at 727. See also Estate of Black, 116 Wn. App. 476,
490, 66 P.3d 670 (2003), affd, 153 Wn. 2d 152 (2004). Courts in
dissolution proceedings have considered a party’s intransigence to
be a factor in making an award of attorney’s fees. Mafison v.

Mattson, 94 Wn. App. 592, 604, 976 P.2d 154 (1999).

B. The Trial Court Did Not Abuse Its Discretion In
Awarding Fees and Costs against Bill Miller.

Bill Miller's Brief for the most part sets out a litany of wrongs
he claims to have suffered in connection with his mother's estate.
Much of what Bill Miller recites is unsupported by citation to the

record on appeal and much is irrelevant to the question of whether

20




the trial court abused its discretion in making the award of fees and
costs that is under review. Mr. Bill Miller misperceives the nature of

this appeal. A reading of his opening brief suggests he views the

appeal as a vehicle to relitigate matters that were considered below
and rejected by the Superior Court in various orders (other than the
attorney’s fee award).

Bill's brief is totally silent on three critical issues: (1) an
acknowledgement that as the Personal Representative, John Miller
was entitled to exclusive possession of the University Street house
during the pendency of probate proceedings; and (2) that as
Personal Representative, John Miller had the right to decide that
the listing and sale of the house was in the best interest of the
Estate and all of its heirs; and (3) that notwithstanding efforts to
work out a solution so that Bill could remain in and receive the
University Street house, Bill failed to cooperate in those efforts and
failed to seek or obtain the financing necessary to make up the
difference between his estimated share of the Estate residue and

the value of the University Street house.

21



1. The Personal Representative Was Entitled
to Possession of the University Street House.

Title to property in an estate vests in the heirs on death. In
2d 1, 13, 93 P.3d 147 (2004). Heirs of |

the Estate, however, are not entitled to possession of Estate
property until probate has been completed. In re Peterson’s Estate,
12 Wn.2d 686, 754-755, 123 P.3d 733 (1942) (“Only after an estate
has been closed can the heirs, by acquiring these additional rights
in the property, become entitled to treat it as their own.”). In that
regard, RCW 11.04.250 provides:

[NJo person shall be deemed a devisee until the will has

been probated. The title and right to possession of such

lands, tenements, or hereditaments so vested in such heirs

or devisees, fogether with the rents, issues, and profits

thereof, shall be good and valid against all persons claiming

adversely to the claims of any such heirs, or devisees,
excepting only the personal representative when appointed .

Even a Personal Representative may not treat Estate
property as his own. Where he does, he is liable to compensate
the Estate for such personal use. In re Estate of Jones, supra, 152
Wn.2d 1, 93 P.3d 147 (2004) (Personal Representative must pay
rent when he resides in Estate property and treats it as his own).
This Court reaffirmed this rule in 2015 in In re Estate of Wimberley, |

186 Wn. App 475, 349 P.3d 11 (2015).
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2, As Personal Representative In A
Nonintervention Estate, John Could Take Such Steps As
He Deemed Necessary To Administer Estate Property.

John Miller and Bill Miller were named in the decedent’s Will

to serve as Personal Representative with nonintervention powers.
CP 368-373. Bill Miller resigned after it was disclosed he had
misappropriated Estate funds for his personal use.

The Personal Representative in a nonintervention probate
has the power, among other things, to “mortgage, encumber, lease,
sell, exchange, convey” real and personal property of the estate”
* * * all without an order of court and without notice, approval, or
confirmation * * *.” RCW 11.68.090. As such, John Miller, as
Personal Representative, had full authority to take possession of
estate property and sell that property. In re Estate of Jones, supra,
152 Wn.2d at 14 (Personal Representative “is entitled to possess
and control estate property during the administration of the estate
and has a right to it even against other heirs.”).

John had an absolute to possession of the University Street
house without court intervention. However, because the issue of
evicting one of the siblings, and an estate beneficiary, ‘was a
sensitive and contentious issue, John deemed it prudent,

reasonable and conciliatory to submit the matter to the Court in the
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form of a Petition for Instructions, rather than taking the unilateral
action he clearly had the authority to take. The Petition for

Instructions was filed only as a last resort, after Bill ignored and

disregarded the efforts of John and his current and prior counsel to
reach agreement with him regarding setting a price for the house
and his obtaining a loan to finance the portion of the price in excess
of his distributive share of the estate residue. See CP 145 (John
Miller has “bent over backward” attempting to accommodate Bill's

desire to receive the University St. house).

3. The Record Establishes That The Court’s
Award of Attorney’s Fees and Costs Was Not An Abuse
of Discretion.
As previously discussed in Section A, above, a trial court’s

award of attorney’s fees under Statutes will not be disturbed on
appeal unless the trial court abused its discretion in making such an
award. Bill Miller's brief is utterly silent as to the legal standard to
be applied by this Court, and he does not argue what facts, in his
view, establish that the trial court abused its discretion in making its
fee award. Such an argument would be difficult to make, inasmuch
as the record establishes a clear pattern on the part of Bill Miller of
non-responsiveness, non-cooperation and even obstructive

behavior in these proceedings.
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Dorothy Miller made no specific bequests to her three
children. Notwithstanding Bill Miller's protestations that his mother

wanted him to have the University Street house, there is no

indication, other than Bill's statements, that that was the case.
Dorothy’s Last Will and Testament bequeathed 40% of the Estate
residue to Bill, 40% to John and 20% to Lori Montgomery. CP 368-
373. Nevertheless, Bill wanted the house, and John sought initially
to accommodate that request. See CP 143-145. Discussions
concerning Bill's receipt of the house dated at least to 2013, when
Larry Siegel was still the Estate attorney. CP 143. Initially a value
of $135,000 was put on the house, a figure Bill agreed with. CP
143. However, Bill recognized and acknowiedged in 2013 that he
would need a loan to make up the difference between his
distributive share of the residue and the value of the house. CP
143. See also CP 110, || 5-6 (Bill's acknowledgement that he
would need a loan).

On February 14, 2014, a proposal was made to Bill to value
the house at $152,000. CP 003, § 16. This was somewhat less

than the tax assessed value of the house and adjacent lot.” CP

" This proposed price turned out to be very accurate. Once Bill was removed
from the house, it and the adjacent lot were sold to separate purchasers for an
aggregate price of $152,000. CP 315, { 13.
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003, 1 12-13. Bill was informed that if an agreement couid not be
reached, the house would have to be sold to a third party. CP 003,

f16. There was no substantive response to John’s proposal. CP

003, ] 16. As a result, Bill was served with a 20-day Notice to
Vacate. CP 003, § 17. He did not vacate and unlawful detainer
proceedings fo_IIowed. The result of those proceedings was
issuance of a Writ of Restitution. CP 004, | 20.

The same day the Writ was issued, Bill visited counsel's
office and left a note expressing his continuing interest in receiving
the house. CP 004, 9 21. Taking Bill's note as a sign of good faith,
John agreed to vacate the Writ of Restitution to permit further
discussions with Bill concerning his receiving the house as his
share of the estate. CP 004, § 21. Bill was told he would need to
apply for a loan. CP 004, 9 22. He responded on August 22, 2014,
with a note proposing that the house be put ih his name so he could
receive a loan. CP 004, 9 23. He was informed that would not be
possible. CP 004-005 {] 23. Thereafter, for the next six weeks,
nothing further was heard from Bill.

On October 7, 2014, a letter was sent to Bill again raising the
issue of his obtaining a loan. CP 005, § 24. The letter also noted

that he needed to compensate the estate for what then was 37
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months of rent-free occupancy. CP 005, 1 24. Ten days later, Bill
came to counsel’s office and admitted that he had never applied

for a loan. CP 005, § 25. In view of Bill's admission, the Personal

Representative determined it prudent to petition the Court for
Instructions seeking an order for a firm timetable for Bill Miller to
apply for financing. If he did not so apply, or if he did not receive
financing, the house would be listed and sold.

Bill did apply to GESA Credit Union for a loan and so
certified to the Superior Court. CP 028-029. He did not certify that
he had obtained loan approval, and on January 9, 2015, the
Personal Representative filed a Motion for Order to Vacate. CP 33-
34. On February 2, 2015, the Superior Court entered an order to
Vacate, requiring Bill to vacate the University Street house not later
than Midnight, March 2, 2015. CP 54-56. Bill, through counsel,
filed a Motion for Reconsideration of the Order to Vacate. CP 057.
On February 19, 2015, Judge Lohrmann requested briefing from
counsel on the Motion for Reconsideration. CP 062-063. Following
submission of briefs (CP 064-073; CP 58-61), the Superior Court
denied the Motion. CP 81-83. The Order Denying Reconsideration

set a deadline of March 31, 2016 for Bill to vacate the house. Bill
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Miller refused to comply with the Court's Order and continued to
live, rent-free, in the house. CP 131, | 11.

Ultimately, John had to resort to unlawful detainer

proceedings to remove Bill from the house. Those proceedings
resulted in the removal of Bill Miller and two of his friends or tenants
from the house on July 27, 2017. CP 131-132, | 13-21.
Thereafter, the Personal Representative incurred substantial costs
removing junk cars, tractors and scrap and other trash from the
property, so that it could be listed and sold by a real estate agent.
CP 313-331.

While the unlawful detainer proceedings were pending, Bill
Miller retained attorney Gregory Dow (his third attorney) to
represent him in the probate matter.® Mr. Dow filed on Bill Miller's
behalf a Request for Instructions that sought the removal of John
Miller as Personal Representative, with Bill Miller being reappointed
in that role. CP 114-117 (Memorandum in Support). The Request
also sought to have the Court require the sale of the University
Street house to Bill Miller for $121,500 (CP 117) and, incredibly, to
require the Estate — effectively John Miller and Lori Montgomery as

the other two residuary beneficiaries - to finance the shortfall

® Mr. Dow did not appear in the unlawful detainer proceedings.

28



between Bill Miller's share of the estate residue and the house’s
price. (CP 117). The Request also sought a preliminary

distribution of $40,000 to Bill Miller. With the exception of the

request for a distribution, the Superior Court denied the Request for
Instructions. CP 241-243. Mr. Dow also filed a Motion seeking to
disqualify David S. Grossman and the Minnick-Hayner firm from
representing John Miller as the estate’s Personal Representative.
CP 180-181. The Superior Court also denied that motion. CP 229-
233. Gregory Dow withdrew as Bill Miller's attorney by Notice filed
December 21, 2015. CP 401.

On February 29, 2016, the Court entered its Order awarding
attorney’s fees and costs, which Order Bill Miller appeals from. CP
353-355.

The foregoing all was considered by the Walla Walla
Superior Court in making it's award of attorney’s fees and costs.
Indeed, the Court exercised considerable restraint in only awarding
fees and costs until after the pattern of Bill Miller’s tactics of delay
and obstruction was well demonstrated. Thé Personal
Representative’s initial request for an award of fees and costs was
made initially in his Motion to Charge Heir's Interest for Occupancy

of Estate Property; for Award of Attorney’s Fees and to Account for
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rent Received, filed on August 21, 2015. Although the Court
entered an Order imposing a fair rental of $700 per month against

Bill, it nevertheless deferred a ruling on attorney’s fees. CP 234-

237. The Court ultimately entered the order appealed from herein
on February 29, 2016. CP 353-355. In view of the entire record in
this matter, it is apparent that Judge Lohrmann of the Walla Walla
Superior Court did not abuse his discretion in making the award of

fees and costs appealed from.

C. irrelevant Argquments

Bill Miller views this appeal as an opportunity to rehash and
relitigate everything that has taken place in the probate
proceediyngs with which he disagrees. With the exception of the
Order awarding attorney’s fees and costs, none of these other
matters are the subject of this appeal. Nevertheless, as
Respondent, John Miller believes it appropriate to address, briefly,
Bil's arguments.

1. Claimed Non-Probate Asset.

Bill attempts to justify his use of Estate funds for the
payment of personal goods and services by arguing that the funds
in question were non-probate assets from accounts in the joint

names of Dorothy, John and Bill. Appellant’s Brief 7-10. As of the
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date of Dorothy’'s death, there were funds held in such accounts.
However, Dorothy’s Last Will and Testament clearly specified that

all of her property was to be dealt with under her will,

notwithstanding conflicting beneficiary designation. CP 371. John
and Bill discussed the accounts with then-attorney Larry Siegel,
and it was agreed that the funds would be used for Estate
purposes. CP 147-148. After Bil's misappropriation of Estate
funds was discovered, he agreed to resign as co-Personal
Representative. CP 377.

Bil's arguments regarding the so-called non-probate assets
were raised as an issue in his Request for Instructions, filed by
attorney Greg Dow. CP 114-117. The Superior Court denied this
request, as well as most other relief sought in Bill's Request for
Instructions. CP 241-243. Issues regarding the accounts and the
circumstances of Bill's resignation as co-Personal Representative
are irrelevant to the issue under appeal.

2. Bill Miller's Representation by Brandon

Johnson
Bill Miller notes accurately that he was represented at one point by
Brandon Johnson. Appellant’s Brief 13-14. He appears to object to

being served with a 20-Day Notice to Vacate, while he was
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represented by Brandon Johnson, claiming it was a breach of
ethics on the part of counsel for the Estate. Mr. Johnson’s

representation was in the probate matter. That Notice was required

to be served on Mr. Miller under the unlawful detainer statute.
RCW 59.12.080. Service on Mr. Miller was not an attempt to
circumvent communicating with his then-attorney. Moreover, had
he wished representation by Brandon Johnson in the unlawful
detainer matter, he could have requested it.
3. Arguments Regarding Unlawful Detainer

Mr. Miller rehashes arguments made in the unlawful detainer
case, that he was a tenant at will and there was no jurisdiction to
proceed against him under the unlawful detainer statute.
Appellant's Brief 14-16. These are all arguments that Mr. Miller
made before the Superior Court in the unlawful detainer action,
which arguments were rejected by the Court. Mr. Miller also
contends that no demand for possession was made. Appellant’s
Brief, 19. To the contrary, the 20-day Notice to Vacate served on
Mr. Miller on Jun3 4, 20154, was just such a demand. CP 003, |
17. Mr. Miller, then represented by Lenard Wittlake — attorney No.
2 — argued before the Superior Court that unlawful detainer was not

the appropriate vehicle to use to restore possession of Estate
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property to the Personal Representative. CP 019-023. The
Superior Court implicitly rejected such arguments when it ruled on

John'’s Request for Instructions. CP 025-027.

V.
REQUEST FOR ATTORNEY’S FEES ON APPEAL

The Superior Court awarded the Estate attorney’s fees and
costs against Bill Miller by reason of his conduct throughout the
majority of these proceedings. Even after it became apparent that
he was unable to receive the University Street house without a
loan, and that he was unable to obtain such a loan, he refused to
vacate the house. He ignored and defied the Superior Court’s
Order to Vacate. His conduct resulted in the Estate incurring
attorney’s fees and costs that should have been unnecessary. This
appeal is yet another examplé of Bill Miller's conduct causing the
Estate to incur yet more attorney’s fees.

Pursuant to RCW 11.96A.150 and RAP 18.1, the Estate, by
John Miller, Personal Representative, requests that the Court

award attorney’s fees in its favor and against Appellant Bill Miller.
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VL.
CONCLUSION

The Appellant, Bill Miller, has not established that the Walla

Walla Superior Court abused its discretion in awarding attorney’s
fees against Bill Miller with respect to the Personal
Representative’s efforts to regain possession of the University
Street house so that it could be sold. Rather, the record in this
appeal demonstrates clearly that throughout the proceedings
below, Bill Miller was nonresponsive and, later, sought to obstruct
the efforts of John Miller, as Personal Representative, to conclude
the probating of their mother’'s estate. The trial court did not abuse
its discretion, and Bill Miller's appeal should be denied.

RESPECTFULLY SUBMITTED this 24" day of

AL s _—

DAVID S. GROSSMAN, WSBA #18428
MinnickeHayner, P.S.

PO Box 1757

249 W. Alder St.

Walla Walla, WA 99362

Telephone: (509) 527-3500

E-mail: Grossman@minnickhayner.com
Attorneys for Respondent John Miller,
Personal Representative

October, 2016.
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In the Matter of the Estate of
No. 11-4-00161-8
'DOROTHY C. MILLER,

n - | DECLARATION OF DAVIDS.
Deceased. GROSSMAN RE: RENEWED MOTION

FOR ATTORNEY’S FEES AND COSTS

I, DAVID S. GROSSMAN, declare as follows under penalty of perjury under the laws of
the State of Washing’ton.

1.  Tam oflegal age and am competent to testify to the matters in this Declaration.
The statements in this Declaration are true and correct. I make this Declaration in support of the
Personal Representative’s Renewed Motion to Charge Heir’s Interest for Attorney’s Fees and
Costs.

2. For further background, I refer the Court to my Declarations filed in this matter
on October 31, 2014, and August 13, 2015.

3. Since I appeared in this case in 2014, substituting for Larry Siegel, a significant
amount of attome)‘(-.time and effort was devoted to dealing with estate heir Bill Miller, his

occupation of the house at 1356 University Street, efforts to accommodate Bill Miller’s desire to

Minnick « Hayner
T P.O.By
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receive the house as his distributive share of the estate and efforts to remove him from the house
after it became clear that he was unable to obtain a Joan to contribute to the purchase price.
4, Significant attorney time was devoted to removing Bill Miller from the house in

this probate proceeding and in the related unlawful detainer matter, Cause No. 14-200454-1.

5. I'was required to spend a total of 29.7 hours in the unlawful detainer action, fora
total fee amount of $6,607.50. Costs and expenses totaled $2,350.80. The time spent on this
matter is well in excess of that spent on a normal unlawful detainer because of the conduct and

actions of Bill Miller. Among the actions that required the expenditure of significant attorney

10 time was the filing of a counterclaim, which required a motion to dismiss for lack of jurisdiction
z; and extensive briefing and arguments regarding claimed tenancy at will.- It was necessary to. .-
13 ||schedule the eviction twice because two individuals were at the house who claimed to be

14 || subtenants of Bill Miller when the Sheriff went there in June to execute the Writ. A further Writ
15 was required, which was ultimately executed July 27, 2016.

¢ 6. Attached hereto as Exhibit “A” is a true and accurate copy of a Time and

]; Expense Detail report generated by Minnick Hayner’s accounting program. The report details
19 {|the time spent on the unlawful detainer matter and fees and costs incurred. All of my time was
20 |}billed at $225 per hour, which is my usual hourly rate. All time I spent on the unlawful detainer
21 1l action was necessary under the circumstances and was the result of the intransigence of Bill

z Miller in resisting the efforts of the personal representative to remove him from the house so it
24 could be listed and sold.

25 7. Attached hereto as Exhibit “B” is a rue and accurate copy of a Time and Expense
26 || Detail report generated by Minnick-Hayner’s accounting program. The report details time spent
2 on this matter since I joined Minnick-Hayner on October 1, 2014 in relation to this probate
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proceeding. I have identified, and highlighted, time entries related to efforts to restore

possession of the University Street house to the Personal Representative and to remove Bill

3 || Miller from the house. In identifying the time, I have tried to be conservative and have only
% || identified time entries that were clearly related to the issue of restoring possession of the house to
: the Personal Representative.
6
, ||are not highlighted as the time was combined with other work done relating to the probate. In
g || particular, I have not included time entries in October 2014 and subsequent related to the Petition
9 for Instructio‘ns‘ which, in part, sought guidelines and a timetable for Bill Miller to apply for and
10 obtain financing. Per Exhibit “B”, total hours of 20.1 have been identified as relating directly to
. : the issue of restoring ,p,o,ss,es,sioh,Qf,the,,hQuse to the Personal Representative. Atmy usual rateof
13 || $225 per hour, these entries totals $4,747.50.
14 8. The Personal Representative seeks an Order charging Bill Miller’s distributive
15 |l share in the estate residue for a total of $11,355.00 in attorney fees and $2,350.80 in costs as
16 detailed herein and in the Declaration of John Miller, filed herewith.
: 9. The expenditure of attorney’s fees and costs relating to removing Bill Miller from
19 || the house has been a benefit to the estate. The house and related parcel sold for a total of
20 {|$152,000, which is significantly in excess of what would have been generated had the two
2 parcels been sold together.
z The foregoing statements are true and correct and made under penalty of perjury this st
” day of February, 2016, at Walla Walla, Washington.
? LSy ——
2 David S. Grossman, WSBA #18428
27 |
28
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Minnick-Hayner
Time And Expense Details
Report ID:  OT2025 - 5456 ‘ Printed By ~SA
Thursday, January 21, 2016 Date [01/01/2000 - 01/31/2016] Page 1
Client Client Reporting Name Matter Matter Reporting Name Billing Timekeeper
F436 MILLER, DOROTHY 00002 EVICTION OF SON (WILLIAM) Grossman, David
Unbilled Time
Date Timekeeper Hours Hours To Rate Amount Task Activity Narrative
Worked Bill
6/1/2015 DG 0.20 0.20 225.00 $45.00 CONFER WITH SYLVIA ACOSTA REGARDING MOVE-QUT ARRANGEMENTS;
’ TELEPHONE CALL TO CLANCY'S MOVING.
6/2/2015 DG 1.20 1.20 225.00 $270.00 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY ELIZABETH POWELL
REGARDING MOVE-OUT; TELEPHONE CALL TO JOHN MILLER REGARDING
INTERIM DISTRIBUTION TO BILL MILLER TO PROYIDE FUNDS FOR MOVE.
6/11/2015 DG 0.20 0.20 225.00 $45.00 LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING WRIT OF FOSSSESION.
6/11/2015 DG 0.20 0.20 225.00 $45.00 LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING WRIT OF POSSESSION.
6/15/2015 DG 0.50 0.50 225.00 $112.50 TELEPHONE CALL FROM TACOMA ATTORNEY, E. POWELL REGARDING BILL
MILLER EVICTION; TELEPHONE CALL TO ATTORNEY W. MARQUARTISON TO
DISCUSS EVICTION [SSUES. I
6/16/2015 DG 1.90 1.90 225.00 $427.50 PREPARE MOTION FOR REISSUANCE OF WRIT OF RESTITUTION, PROPOSED
ORDER; TO COURT FOR ENTRY OF ORDER AND ISSUANGE OF WRIT; LETTER
TO BILL MILLER ATTORNEY E. POWELL REGARDING REISSUANCEQF WRIT.
6/18/2015 DG 0.50 0.50 225.00 $112.50 CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL ASSISTANT S. ACOSTA REGARDING =
ARRANGEMENTS FOR MOVERS, LOCKSMITH, VEHICLE TOW-AWAY; REVIEW
EMAIL FROM JOHN MILLER REGARDING EVICTION; REVIEW EMAIL FROM
ATTORNEY E. POWELL REGARDING NO LONGER REPRESENTIN L
MILLER.
6/22/2015 DG 3.50 3.50 225.00 $787.50 REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAIL FROM JOHN MILLER REGARD! T VICTION;
REVIEW LATEST FILING BY BILL MILLER; TELEPHONE CONFERE WITH
JOHN MILLER; PREFARE ORDER DENYING MOTION TO DISMISS OpCAWFUL
DETAINER; TO COURT TO HAVE ORDER ENTERED; TELEPHONE FERENCE
WITH LATEST BILL MILLER ATTORNEY, GREG DOW; LEGAL RES H. (NO
CHARGE 1.0 HOUR)
6/23/2015 DG 2.60 2.60 225.00 $585.00 TO UNIVERSITY ST. HOME ON SHERIFF'S EXECUTION OF WRIT OF
RESTITUTION; LETTER TQ KIM DOWNING AND OHTER OCCUPANTS
REGARDING CLAIM TO BE TENANTS; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JOHN
MILLER; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LARRY SIEGEL REGARDING JOINT
BANK ACCOUNT.
6/29/2015 DG 0.60 0.60 225.00 $135.00 REVIEW UNLAWFUL DETAINER STATUTE; EMAIL ATTORNEY EVAN LOEFFLER;
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LOEFFLER REGARDING EVICTION
PROCEDURE; TELEPHONE CALL TO JEFF BURKHART.
6/30/2015 DG . 020 0.20 225.00 $45.00 TELEPHONE CALLS FROM JEFF BURKHART REGARDING STATUS OF
) EVICTION AND HIS CLIENT'S NON-AGREEMENT WITH MEDIATION.
7M7/2015 DG 0.40 0.40 225.00 $90.00 TO COURT FOR REISSUANCE OF WRIT OF RESTITUTION.
7/20/12015 DG 0.30 0.30 225.00 $67.50 RECEIVE AND REVIEW PLEADINGS FILED BY BILL MILLER.
712212015 DG 0.30 0.30 225.00 $67.50 TELEPHONE CALL FROM ATTORNEY GREG DOW; EMAIL TO GREG DOW.
7/23/2015 DG 1.10 1.10 225.00 $247.50 TELEPHONE CALL FROM KiM DOWNING; CONFERENCE WITH MONA GEIDL
REGARDING EVICTION; REVIEW THREATENING EMAIL FROM JOHN MILLER;
PREPARATION OF LONG EMAIL TO GREG DOW.
712712015 DG 2.80 2.80 22500 $630.00 CONFERENCE WITH JOHN & MICK! MILLER; TC HOUSE TO SUPERVISE
EVICTION; FURTHER CHECK ON STATUS AT HOUSE AT END OF DAY.




ReportiD:  OT2025 - 5456
Thursday, January 21, 2016

Minnick-Hayner

Time And Expense Details

Printed By SA

Date [01/01/2000 - 01/31/2016] Page 2
Unbilled Time
Totals 16.50 16.50 $3,712.50
Billed Time
Date Timekeeper Hours  Hours On Rate Amount Task Activity Narrative
Waorked Bilt
10/13/2014 DG 0.10 0.10 225.00 $22.50 TF BILL MILLER FRIEND RE BILL MILLER'S DESIRE TO MEET
10/15/2014 DG 0.00 0.00 250.00 $0.00 PREPARATION OF MOTION FOR ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE
10/17/2014 DG 1.50 1.50 225.00 $337.50 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE TO BILL MILLER; TELEPHONE CALL TO BILL
MILLER; MEETING WITH BILL MILLER AND SCOTT KRIKA; TT LARRY SIEGEL;
REVIEW OF FILE FOR EVIDENCE BILL MILLER PROVIDED INFORMATION RE
TIME WORKED ON J ST. AND BUSH ST HOUSES
4/7/2015 DG 0.50 - 0.50 225.00 $112.50 PREPARE AMENDED COMPLAINT FOR UNLAWFUL DETAINER.
4/8/2015 DG 0.20 0.20 225.00 $45.00 REVISE UNLAWFUL DETAINER PLEADINGS; TELEPHONE CALL TO LORI
MONTGOMERY ATTORNEY JEFF BURKHART. V|
4/9/2015 DG 0.50 0.50 225.00 $112.50 FURTHER REVISIONS TO AMENDED COMPLAINT FOR UNLAWFUL DETAINER;
COURT APPEARANCE TO HAVE ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE ISSUED.
4/14/2015 DG 0.20 0.20 225.00 $45.00 CONFIRM SERVICE OF UNLAWFUL DETAINER; EMAIL TO REAL ESTATE AGENT
C. HUSTED REGARDING FAIR RENTAL AMOUNT FOR UNIVERSITY' HOUSE.
4/27/2015 DG 1.40 1.40 225.00 $315.00 PREPARE FOR HEARING ON UNLAWFUL DETAINER; REVIEW BILLRIILLER'S
ANSWER; ATTEND COURT ON HEARING FOR UNLAWFUL CETAINER
(CONTINUED 2 WEEKS AT REQUEST OF BILL MILLER). L
5/11/2015 DG 4.30 4.30 225.00 $967.50 TO COURT FOR HEARING ON UNLAWFUL DETAINER; LEGAL RES H;
CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY WARREN MARQUARDSON; TELE! NE CALL
TO JEFF BURKHART; EMAIL TO JOHN MILLER. H
5/12/2015 DG 1.50 1.50 225.00 $337.50 PREPARATION OF FINDINGS OF FACT & ORDER; REVISE SAME.
5/13/2015 DG 0.60 0.60 225.00 $135.00 RECEIVE & REVIEW AMDENDED ANSWER AND COUNTERCLAIM; Em FOR
TRIAL.
5/14/2015 DG 1.10 1.10 225.00 $247.50 REPLY TO EMAIL FROM JOHN MILLER; TELEPHONE CALL TO JEFF BURKHART;
PREPARATION OF MOTION TO DISMISS COUNTERCLAIM, NOTE FOR MOTION
DOCKET & OBJECTION TO NOTE FOR TRIAL SETTING.
5/22/2015 DG 0.80 0.80 225.00 $180.00 PREPARE FINDINGS OF FACT, CONCLUSIONS OF LAW & ORDER ON
UNLAWFUL DETAINER; RECEIVE & REVIEW BILL MILLER'S MOTION TO
: DISMISS.
5/28/2015 SA 0.50 0.50 75.00 $37.50 PREPARE AND OBTAIN WRIT FROM CLERK'S OFFICE; LETTER TO SHERIFF;
DELIVER TO SHERIFF FOR SERVICE; EMAIL TO CLIENT.
Billed Time
Totals 13.20 13.20 $2,895.00

Billed Expenses

Date Amount Exp Code Narrative
4/15/2015 $24.60 SERV WALLA WALLA COUNTY SHERIFF; Invoice # 201501122; PROCESS SERVICE ON WILLIAM MILLER AT 1356 UNIVERSITY STREET IN WALLA WALLA
ON 4/13/15
6/16/2015 $39.10 SERV WALLA WALLA COUNTY SHERIFF; Invoice # DOROTHY MILLER EST.; PROCESS SERVICE ON WILLIAM MILLER AT 1356 UNIVERSITY STREET IN
WALLA WALLA ON 5/29/15
6/23/2015 $40.00 SERV BLAKE LIMBURG,; Invoice # DOROTHY MILLER; PROCESS SERVICE ON KIM DOWNING AND ALL OCCUPANTS AT 1356 UNIVERSITY ST. IN WALLA

WALLA ON 6/23/15
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Billed Expenses

Date Amount Exp Code Narrative
6/30/2015 $41.20 SERV WALLA WALLA COUNTY SHERIFF; Invoice # 201501784; PROCESS SERVICE ON WILLIAM MILLER AT 1356 UNIVERSITY STREET IN WALLA WALLA
ON 6/16/15
7/28/2015 $142.50 SERV BLAKE LIMBURG; Invoice # F436-2 MILLER ESTATE; MOVE OUT OF WILLIAM MILLER AND ALL OTHER OCCUPRANTS.
71282015 $142.50 Ef24 BRYCE HEUETT; Invoice # F436-2 MILLER ESTATE; MOVE OUT OF WILLIAM MILLER AND ALl OTHER OCCUPANTS.
7/28/2015 $127.50 EfN24 DAVID ARMSTRONG; Invoice # F436-2; MOVE OUT OF WILLIAM MILLER AND ALL OTHER OCCUPANTS.
7/28/2015 $105.00 Ef24 - DREW LIMBURG; Invoice # F436-2 MILLER ESTATE; MOVE OUT OF WILLIAM MILLER AND ALLL OTHER QCCUPANTS.
7129/2015 $81.64 MISC VISA; Invoice # 7916; MISCELLANEOUS EXPENSE; HOME DEPOT; TARPS & ROPE FOR PHYSICAL EVICTION
7129/2015 $291.20 SERV WALLA WALLA COUNTY SHERIFF; Invoice # 201502189; PROCESS SERVICE OF WRIT OF RESTITUTION ON WILLIAM MILLER AT 1356 UNIVERSITY
IN WALLA WALLA ON 7/17/15; SHERIFF ON DUTY DURING EVICTION
8/3/2015 $154.64 MISC BENNETT'S LOCKSMITH; Invoice # 3080; MISCELLANEOUS EXPENSE; REKEY LOCKS AND HEAVEY DUTY PADLOCK
8/10/2015 $1,160.92 MISC BEELINE AUTO CENTER; Invoice # 18676; MISCELLANEQUS EXPENSE; TOWING OF 6 VEHICLES
Billed Expenses o
Totals $2,350.80 I
Hours Hours To N
Worked Bill Fee Amount  Expense Amount Total Amount -
Report Totals 29.70 29.70 $6,607.50 $2,350.80 $8,958.30 T
** End Of Report * (48]
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Client Client Reporting Name Matter " Matter Reporting Name Billing Timgkeeper
F436 MILLER, DOROTHY 00001 - ESTATE OF DOROTHY MILLER , ' Grossmanm, David
Unbilled Time
Date Timekeeper Hours Hours To Rate Amount Task Activity Narrative
o \Worked ‘Bill B , o , ]
6/10/2015 DG 0.20 0.20 225.00 $45.00 EMAIL STATUS REPORT TO JOHN MILLER.
6M1/2015 DG 0.10 0.10 225.00 $22.50 EMAILS TO/FROM BILL MILLER ATTORNEY E. POWELL.
6/11/2015. DG 0.10 0.10 225,00 $22.50 EMAILS TO/FROM BILL MILLER'S ATTORNEY, E. POWELL.
7152015 D@ 0.70 0.70 225.00 $157.50 PREPARATION OF MOTION AND ORDER FOR REISSUANCE OF WRIT OF
RESTITUTION.
71172015 DG 0.30 0.30 225.00 '$67.50 LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING WIMBERLY ESTATE CASE.
7/28/2015 DG 0.10 0.10 295.00 $22.50 TELEPHONE CALL FROM CPA KELLY RICE REQUESTING IOLTA LEDGER.
_7I29/2015 DG 0.10 0.10 225.00 $22,50 EMAIL TO KELLY RICE REGARDING TRUST ACCOUNT LEDGER. =
" 8M1/2015 DG 5.40 5.40 225.00 $1,215.00 EMAILS TO JOHN MILLER; BEGIN PREPARATION OF RESPONSES T PETITION
FOR'STATUS REPORT; REQUEST FOR INSTRUCTIONS. _
8/12/2015 DG 1.40 140 225.00 $315.00 EMAILS TQ/FROM JOHN MILLER; CONTINUE PREPARATION OF RESRONSES
TQ REQUEST FOR INSTRUCTIONS, PETITION FOR STATUS REP!
PREPARATION OF DECLARATIONS OF JOHN MILLER & DAVID mm0mm§>z
8/13/2015 DG 0.50 0.50 225.00 $112.50 CONFER WITH TOM SCRIBNER REGARDING HEARING G REQUHAST FOR
INSTRUCTIONS AND PETITION FOR STATUS REPORT; EMAIL BILILNILLER
ATTORNEY GREG DOW,.
8/14/2015 TS 1.50 1.50 200.00 $300.0D CONFERENCE WITH DG RE: MOTION, HEARING; ISSUES, ARGUME
TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH DAHL (MILLER ATTORNEY) RE:: m>_m>_..
MOTION, HEARING ON; PLAN AND PREPARE FOR HEARING ON NS
FILED BY BILL MILLER: REVIEW PLEADINGS, DECLARATIONS ANDCILE,
OUTLINE ISSUES AND ARGLIMENT
8/17/2015 DG 1.30 1,30 225,00 $292.50 CONFERENCE WITH TOM SCRIBNER; LEGAL RESEARCH REGAR CLAIM
: OF CONFLICT OF INTEREST; EMAIL TO JOHN MILLER.
8M7/2015 TS 2.00 2.00 200.00 $400.00 TS TELEPHONE CONFERENGE WITH DG RE: ORDER, HEARING, ESTATE
FINANCE ISSUES; FINALIZE ORDER; EMAIL FROM DOW (MILLER ATTORNEY)
RE: MOTION, NOTES, TRUST ACCOUNT INFO, CONFLICT; EMAIL TO DG RE:
DOW EMAILS, HEARING: COURT RE: HEARING ON. MOTION; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH DG RE: COURT HEARING, ORDERS, CONTINUANCE,
. CONFLICT ISSUES
8M9/2045 DG 1.00. 1.00 225.00 $225.00 BEGIN PREPARATION OF MOTION TO CHARGE INTEREST FOR OCCUPANCY
e AND FOR ATTORNEY'S FEES.
8/20/2015. DG 3.20 3.20 225.00 $720.00 TELEPHONE CALL TO LORI MONTGOMERY ATTORNEY J. BURKHART:
TELEPHONE CALL TO COLDWELL BANKER; REVIEW RICK MILLER EMAIL;
REVISE AND FINALIZE MOTION TO CHARGE FOR OCCUPANCY.
8/21/2015 DG 1.20 1.20 225.00 $270.00 FINAL REVIEW, REVISIONS TO AND FILE MOTION TO CHARGE INTEREST,
DECLARATION, MEMORANDUM & PREPARE NOTE.FOR MOTION DOCKET.
8/24/2015 DG 1.60 1.60 225,00 $360.00 PREPARATION OF RESPONSE TG MOTION TO DISQUALIFY AND CHSGORGE.
8/25/2015 DG 2.50 2.50 225.00 $562.50 LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING DISGORGEMENT OF FEES; REVISE
MEMORANDUM ON DISQUALIFICATION,
8/25/2015 DG 0.50 _ 050 225.00 $112:50 PREPARATION OF RESPONSE TO MOTION TO STRIKE HEARSAY.
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Unbitled Time ) )
' Date Timekeeper Hours Hours Te Rate Amount Task Acfivity Narrative
, Worked Bill , _ .
8/25/2015 MG 0.30 0.30 200.00 $60.00 REVIEW AND REVISE MEMORANDUM IN OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO
: DISQUALIFY.
8/26/2015 DG 0.60 0.60 225.00 $135.00 CONFERENGE WITH TOM SCRIBNER REGARDING HEARSAY DECLARATIONS
OF DEGEDENT, DEADMAN'S STATUTE; EMAILS TO/FROM DOW REGARDING
ACCESS TO HOUSE; PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM ON NON
ADMISSIBILITY OF DECEDENT'S WRITTEN STATEMENTS.
8/26/2015 DG 1.70 1.70 225.00 $382.50 REVIEW AND FINALIZE RESPOMSE TO MOTION QN CONFLICT AND
DISGORGEMENT.
8/28/2015 DG 1.00 1.00 225.00 $225.00 PREPARATION FOR HEARING. .
8312015 DG 3.50 3.50 225.00 $787.50 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING IN SUPERIOR COURT.
9/2/2015 DG 1.50 1.50 225.00 $337.50 PERPARATION OF ORDERS ON VARIOUS MOTIONS; LETTER TO JUDGE
LOHRMANN. .
9/3/2015. DG 1.50 1.50 225.00 $337.50 PERRARATION OF ODERS ON VARIOUS MATIONS; LETTER TO .mem
LOHRMANN: ]
9/9/2045 DG 0.50 0.50 225.00 $112.50 TELEPHONE CALL FROM JOHN MILLER REGARDING WATER SHUF-OFF;
TELEPHONE GALL TO CITY TO RESTORE WATER SERVICE AT I@wmm., E-MAIL
TO ORPFOSING COUNSEL GREG.DOW. -
9/110/2015 DG 0.50 0.50 225.00 $112.50 TO COURT TO DISCUSS DISTRIBUTION TO Bil.L MILLER WITH JUDGE
LOHRMANN; E-MAIL TO-GREG DOW. b~
9/25/2015 DG 0.20 0.20 225.00 $45.00 TELEPHONE CALL FROM KIRK UPTON, COST LESS CARPETS. ==
9/29/2015 DG 0,40 0.40 225.00 $90.00 REVIEW E-MAIL FROM KIM DOWNING REGARDING PERSONAL vamm._.*”
E-MAIL TO JOHN MILLER; E-MAILS TO DOWNING AND ATT EG DOW.
19/12015 DG 0.80 0.80 '225.00- $180.60 TELEPHONE CALL TO BILL MILLER ATTORNEY G. DOW; E-MAIL T¢ HN
MILLER; TELEFHONE CALL TO MICKI MILLER REGARDING DUMPSYER: TO
UNNMERSITY HOUSE TQ PROVIDE ACCESS TO CITY OF WALLA W@l 1A FOR
DUMPSTER.
10/212015 DG 0.30 0.30 225.00 $67.50 REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM JOHN MILLER REGARDING KIM
DOWNING.
101712015 DG 1.10 1.10 225.00 $247.50 TO UNIVERSITY HOUSE TO GIVE ACGESS TO CITY FOR DUMPSTER;
: PREPARATION OF STATUS REPORT ORDERED BY COURT.
10/8/2015 DG 0.20 0.20 225.00 $45.00 REVISIONS TQ STATUS REPORT.
10/9/2015 DG 0.20 0.20 225.00. $45.00. REVISIONS TO STATUS REPORT.
10/22/2015 DG 0.50. 0.50- 225.00 $112.50 PREPARATION OF STATUS REPORT; EMAIL TO JOHN MILLER.
10/2312015 DG 1.20 1.20 225.00 $270.00 REVISE STATUS REPOST; LONG EMAIL TO JOHN MILLER REGARDING STATUS
REPORT AND VARIOUS MATTERS.
10/28/2015 BG 0.30 0.30 225.00 $67.50 EMAILS TO AND FROM GREG DOW; FINALIZE STATUS REPORT FOR FILING.
11/30/2015 DG 0.30 0.30 225.00 $67.50 REVIEW FILE REGARDING STATUS OF TITLE; EMAIL TO LAND TITLE
REGARDING WHETHER DUANE MILLER IS ON THE TITLE; EMAIL TC LARRY
SIEGEL AND JOHN MiLLER.
12/1/2016 DG 0.30 0.30 225.00 $67.50 REVIEW AUDITOR FILES ONLINE FOR RECORDED COMMUNITY PROPERTY
AGREEMENT; EMAIL TO LAND TITLE REGARDING COMMUNITY PROPERTY
AGREEMENT; EMAIL JOHN MILLER AND REALTOR CHERYL HUSTED.
12/8/2015 DG 0.40 0.40 225.00 '$90.00 EMAIL FROM REALTOR CHERYL HUSTED REGARDING HOUSE GLOSING;

EMAIL TO.GREG FLOWERS REGARBING BACK LOT SURVEY; TELEPHONE
CALL WITH GREG FLOWERS; TELEPHONE CALL TO JOHN MILLER.



ReportiD:  OT2025 - 5459
Friday, January 22, 2016

Unbilled Time
Totals

41.00

41.00

/.,

Minnick-Hayner

Date [01/01/2000 - 01/31/2016]

$9,130.00

Time And Expense Details

Printed By SA
Page 3

Unbilled Expenses

Date Amount m.xt Code Narrative
8/26/2015 $40.00 MISC COLDWELL BANKER FIRST REALTORS; Invoice # MILLER; MISCELLANEQUS EXPENSE; PRCPERTY MANAGEMENT PRICE OPTION AT 1356
UNIVERSITY IN WALLA WALLA
Unbilled Expenses
Totals $40.00
Billed Time )
Date Timekeeper Hours  Hours On Rate Amount Task Activity Narrative
Worked Bill
10/2/2014 DG 1.10 1.10 225.00 $247.50 PREPARATION OF HOUSE PURCHASE COMPUTATION; CONFER WITH STEVE
FROL RE SAME; PREPARATION OF LETTER TO WILLIAM MILLER QUSE
PURCHASE 1
10/7/2014 DG 0.70 0.70 225.00 $157.50 CONTINUE PREPARATION OF LETTER TO WILLIAM MILLER; FINALIZE LETTER;
E-MAIL TO JOHN MILLER AND LORI MILLER ATTORNEY JEFF BUR RT
10/21/2014 DG 1.50 1.50 225,00 $337.50 CONFERENCE WITH ATTORNEY STEVE FROL RE PETITION FOR
INSTRUCTIONS; ATTEMPTS TO REACH BitL MILLER FRIEND; BEGRN
PREPARATION OF PETITION FOR INSTRUCTIONS T
10/22/2014 DG 1.20 1.20 225.00 $270.00 REVISE PETITION FOR INSTRUCTIONS; E-MAIL TO JOHN MILLER ame
10/24/2014 DG 0.10 0.10 225.00 $22.50 TELEPHONE CALL TO JOHN MILLER RE PETITION FOR _ijﬁcoém
10/29/2014 DG 2.50 2.50 225.00 $562.50 REVISE PETITION FOR INSTRUCTIONS; PREPARATION OF DEC ION OF
DAVID GROSSMAN IN SUPFORT OF PETITION; PREPARATION OF,
DECLARATION OF REAL ESTATE AGENT CHERYL HUSTED V\
11/11/2014 DG 0.20 0.20 225.00 $45.00 REVIEW E-MAIL FROM JOHN MILLER AND REPLY TO E-MAIL _l_u
1117/2014 DG 1.30 1.30 225.00 $292.50 PREPARATION OF ORDER ON PETITION FOR INSTRUCTIONS
11/21/2014 DG 0.30 0.30 225.00 $67.50 TELEPHONE CALL FROM ATTORNEY LENARD WITTLAKE RE REPRESENTING
BILL MILLER; E-MAILS TO JOHN MILLER, JEFF BURKHART; TELEPHONE CALL
TO COURT CLERK RE CONTINUING HEARING
12/3/2014 DG 0.40 0.40 225.00 $380.00 TELEPHONE CALL TO ATTORNEY LENARD WITTLAKE (REPRESENTING BILL
MILLER); REVIEW FILE RE: PREVIQUS DISTRIBUTIONS; FURTHER TELEPHONE
CALL FROM WITTLAKE; E-MAIL TO WITTLAKE RE DISTRIBUTIONS
12/4/2014 DG 0.80 0.80 22500 $180.00 REVIEW E-MAIL FROM LENARD WITTLAKE, ATTORNEY FOR BILL MILLER;
REVIEW FILE AND E-MAIL INVENTORY LIST TO WITTLAKE; TELEPHONE
CONFERENCE WITH WITTLAKE; TELEPHONE CALL TO LORI MONTGOMERY
JEFF BURKHART
12/5/2014 DG 1.50 1.50 225.00 $337.50 REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM JOHN MILLER; REVISE FINDINGS OF
FACT, CONCLUSIONS OF LAW AND ORDER; PREPARATION FOR HEARING ON
PETITION FOR INSTRUCTIONS
12/8/2014 DG 4,00 4.00 225.00 $900.00 PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING ON PETITION FOR INSTRUCTIONS;

PREPARE ORDER PER JUDGE LOHRMANN'S RULING; E-MAIL TO JEFF
BURKHART AND LENARD WITTLAKE RE ORDER; TELEPHONE CALL TO LKARRY
SIEGEL RE ISSUES RAISED BY WITTLAKE; E-MAIL STATUS REPORT TO JOHN
MILLER; REVIEW AND RESPOND TO E-MAIL FROM JEFF BURKHART
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Billed Time
Date Timekeeper :o:..m Hours On Rate Amount Task Activity Narrative
12/9/2014 DG o e mo.. 0.20 225.00: '$45.00 RECEIVE, REVIEW AND REPLY TO E-MAIL FROM LENARD WiT FLARE RE:
ORDER ON PETITION FOR INSTRUCTIONS; E-MAIL TO JOHN MILLER RE CASE
STATUS
12/12/2014 DG 0.30 0.30 225.00 $67.50 TO COURT TO ENTER ORDER ON PETITION FOR INSTRUCTIONS; E-MAIL TO
COUNSEL; E-MAIL TO JOHN MILLER
12118/2014 DG 0.30 0.30 225.00. $67.50 REVIEW PROPOSED-ORDER ON STATUS REPORT; E-MAIL TO JOHN MILLER;
REVIEW BURKHART DECLARATION
12/22/2014 DG 0.50 0.50 225.00 $112.50 REVIEW LONG E-MAIL FROM JOHN MILLER ON PETITION FOR STATUS
REPORT AND ACCOUNTING ISSUES; TO COURT FOR HEARING ON MOTION
1/6/2015 DG 1.19 1.10 225.00 $247.50 BEGIN PREPARATION OF STATUS REPORT
1/8/2015 DG 0.30 0.30 225.00 $67.50 TELEPHONE CALL TO JEFF BURKHART; REVISE ORDER TO REQUIRE BILL
MILLER TO VACATE
1/9/2015 DG 0.50 0.50 225.00 $112.50 REVIEW COURT DOCKET ONLINE PREPARE ORDER TO VACATE; 4m_quzm
CONFERENCE WITH LENARD WITTLAKE
1/9/2015 DG. 0.50 0.50 225.00 $112.50 “TELEPHONE CALL FROM LENARD WITTLAKE; PREPARE MOTION x_m VACATION
OF PREMISES; NOTE FOR HEARING;
1/20/2015 DG 2.40 2.40 225.00 .$540.00 TO-COURT FOR HEARING ON MOTION TO EVICT BILL MILLER AI%‘O
CONTINUED); CONFERENGCE WITH LENARD WITTLAKE AND JEFF BURKHART;
REVIEW ACCOUNTING; PREPARATION OF STATLUS REFORT
121/2015 DG 0.60 0.60 225.00 $135.00 FINALIZE STATUS REPORT; ARRANGE PAYMENT OF 2012 REAL &Iumr._.m
TAXES; E-MAIL TO LENARD WITTLAKE AND JEFF BURKHART
127/2015 DG 0.20 0.20 225.00 $45.00 fREVIEW FILE RE: BEQUESTS TO GRANDCHILDREN; REVIEW BILIZMLLER
DECLARATION; E-MAIL TO JOHN MILLER.
1/28/2015 DG 0.50 0.50 225.00 $112.50 PREPARATION OF SUPPLEMENTAL STATUS REPORT OF PR, STATUYS REPORT
TO COURT
1/29/2015 DG 0.50 0.50 225.00 $112.50 LEGAL RESEARCH RE RIGHT TO POSSESSION OF HOUSE, _u><ZE. OF RENT
FOR USE
2/2/2015 DG 1.00 1.00 225.00 $225.00 ATTEND COURT HEARING ON MOTION TO VACATE HOUSE
2/3/2015 DG 0.30 0.36 225.00 $67.50 TELEPHONE CALL FROM CPA KELLY RICE REGARDING. DOCUMENTS NEEDED
FOR RETURN PREPARATION; FORWARD DOCUMENTS TQ RICE.
2/12/2015 DG 0.30 0.30 225.00 $67.50 REVIEW MOTION TO RECONSIDER.
2/13/2015 DG 0.30 0.30 225.00 $67.50 REVIEW MOTION TO RECONSIDER.
2/18/2015 DG 0.30 0.30 225.00 $67.50 RESEARCH REGARDING NONINTERVENTION STATUS
2/48/2015 DG 0.70 0.70 225.00 $157.50 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDG LOHRMANN AND LENARD WITTLAKE;
TELEPHONE CALL FROM WITTLAKE; E-MAIL. TO JOHN MILLER
2/19/2015 bG 1.00 1.00 225.00 $225.00 REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM JUDGE LOHRMANN; LEGAL RESEARCH
REGARDING NONINTERVENTION, PERSONAL REPRESENTATIVE RIGHT TO
POSSESSION OF ESTATE PROPERTY
212412015 DG 3.40 340 225.00 $765,00 PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM IN OPPOSITION TO MOTION TO
RECONSIDER EVICTION ORDER
2/25/2015 DG 0.80 0.80 225.00 $180.00 CONTINUE PREPARATION OF MEMORANDUM ON RECONSIDERATION
2/26/2015 DG 1.30 1.30 225.00 $292.50 REVISE MEMORANDUM ON RECONSIDERATION
2/27/2015 DG 0.76 070 22500 $157.50 FINALIZE AND FILE MEMORANDUM
3/2/2015 DG 0.20 0.20 225.00 $45.00 REVIEW SALE COSTS; EMAIL TO JOHN MILLER
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Billed Time S .
Date Timekeeper Hours Hours On Rate Amount Task Activity Narrative
, o Worked Bill e . . , .
31212015 DG 0.40 0.40 225.00 o "~ $90.00 ) REVIEW DECISION ON RECONSIDERATION; EMAIL TO JOHN MILLER
REGARDING DECISION.
3/13/2015. DG 0.10 0.10 225.00 $22.50 REVIEWEMAILS FROM JOHN MILLER; EMAIL TO JEFF BURKHART.
3/18/2015 DG 0.20 0.20 22500 $45.00 TELEPHONE CALL TO WINDERMERE AGENT C. HUSTED REGARDING RENTAL

VALUE, LISTING OF HOUSE ONCE VACANT; TELEPHONE CALL TO LENARD
WITTLAKE REGARDING BILL MILLER VAGATING HOUSE.

4/30/2015 DG 0.30 0.30 225.00 $67.50 TELECONFERENCE WITH CPA KELLY RICE REGARDING RETURN
PREPARATION.
Post Date Status . Entry Date  Original Post Period = Original Post Year
05/06/2015  Current Period '04/30/2015 5 2015
5/22/2015 DG 0.50 0.50 225.00 $112.50 STATUS EMAIL TQ JOHN MILLER; PREPARE OBJECTION TO BILL ER
PETITION FOR STATUS REPORT. ’
572612015 DG 1.90 1.90 225.00 $427.50 COURT HEARING ON MOTION TO-DISMISS COUNTERCLAIM; STATUE EMAIL TO
JOHN MILLER; LEGAL RESEARCH REGARDING TENANCY AT WiLL
512712015 DG 0.30 0.30 225.00 $67.50 RECEIVE AND REVIEW ORDER ON EVICTION OF WILLIAM MIL IL.
ORDER TO JONN MILLER & JEFF BURKHART. -
Billed Time T
Totals 37.50 37.50 $8,437.50 m
Billed Expenses 1\ . —
___Dbate  Amount ExpCode Namative T Hse | L
12472015 $1,081.53 MISC WALLA WALLA COUNTY TREASURER: Invgice # DOROTHY MILLER EST.. MISCELLANEOUS EXPENSE; PAY 2012 PROPERTY TAXES VA .
Billed Expenses Ll
Totals $1,081.53
Hours HowrsTo T
Eo,aww,_mn_ Bill Fee Amount Expense Amount Total Amount
Report Totals 78,50 78.50 $17,567.50 $1,121.53 $18,689.03

** End Of Report ***
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

SYLVIA ACOSTA declares under penalty of perjury under
the laws of the State of Washington that the following is true and

- correct:

1. That | am a citizen of the United States, over the age
of 18 years, and not a party to this action;
2. That on October 24, 2016, | caused a true and correct copy
of the foregoing Brief of Respondent, Estate of Dorothy Miller, John

Miller, Personal Representative to be served on

William Miller Lori Montgomery
29 E. Maple St. 807 School Avenue
Walla Walla, WA 99362 Walla Walla, WA 99362

By: [ First Class Mail - by depositing such copy in the United
States mail in the post office at Walla Walla, Washington on said

date, with the postage thereor<;repaid.

Qu Wiz @W‘Wﬂ/

SYLVIA ACOSTA

Signed on the 24th day of October, 2016, at

Walla Walla, Walla Walia County,
Washington
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